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GENOMMA LAB INTERNACIONAL AGREES  

 VOLUNTARY TAX PAYMENT  
 

Mexico City, February 24, 2021 – Genomma Lab Internacional, S.A.B. de C.V. (BMV: LABB) 

(“Genomma Lab” or “the Company”), one of the leading pharmaceutical and personal care product 

companies in Mexico with an expanding international presence, has voluntarily agreed to pay taxes in 

the amount of Ps. 750 million related to a discrepancy associated with judgments made by the Large 

Taxpayers Unit of the Mexican Tax Administration Service ("SAT"), and by that, endorsing our 

commitment to Mexico and the moment that the country is facing. 

The Company’s fourth quarter 2020 Earnings Release and 2020 Financial Statements already reflect 

the above agreement amount. 

Genomma Lab therefore has successfully mitigated the need for any related legal proceedings and 

corresponding time and expenses through said voluntary payment while underscoring the Company’s 

strong commitment to supporting Mexico’s continued recovery efforts during this pandemic. The above 

payment has been fully completed and all discrepancies in judgment and audits opened with the SAT 

from the 2013 fiscal year to date have thereby been resolved. 

 

 

About Genomma Lab Internacional  
Genomma Lab Internacional, S.A.B. de C.V. is one of the leading pharmaceutical and personal care products companies in Mexico 

with an increasing international presence. Genomma Lab develops, sells and markets a broad range of premium branded products, 

many of which are leaders in the categories in which they compete in terms of sales and market share. Genomma Lab relies on the 

combination of a successful new product development process, a consumer-oriented marketing, a broad retail distribution network 

and a low-cost, highly flexible operating model. 

Genomma Lab’s shares are listed on the Mexican Stock Exchange under the ticker “LABB” (Bloomberg: LABB: MM). 

 Note on Forward-Looking Statements  
 

This report may contain certain forward-looking statements and information relating to the Company that reflect the current views 
and/or expectations of the Company and its management with respect to its performance, business and future events. Forward looking 
statements include, without limitation, any statement that may predict, forecast, indicate or imply future results, performance or 
achievements, and may contain words like “believe,” “anticipate,” “expect,” “envisages,” “will likely result,” or any other words or 
phrases of similar meaning. Such statements are subject to a number of risks, uncertainties and assumptions. We caution you that a 
number of important factors could cause actual results to differ materially from the plans, objectives, expectations, estimates and 
intentions expressed in this presentation and in oral statements made by authorized officers of the Company. Readers are cautioned 
not to place undue reliance on these forward-looking statements, which speak only as of their dates. Risks and uncertainties include, 
but are not limited to: risks related to the impact of the COVID19 global pandemic, such as the scope and duration of the outbreak, 
government actions and restrictive measures implemented in response, material delays, supply chain disruptions and other impacts 
to the business, or on the Company’s ability to execute business continuity plans as a result of the COVID-19 pandemic, economic 
factors, such as interest rate and currency exchange rate fluctuations; competition, including technological advances, new products 
attained by competitors; challenges inherent in new product development; the ability of the Company to successfully execute strategic 
plans; the impact of business combinations and divestitures; manufacturing difficulties or delays, internally or within the supply chain; 
significant adverse litigation or government action, including related to product liability claims; changes to applicable laws and 
regulations, including tax laws; changes in behavior and spending patterns of purchasers of products and services; financial instability 
of international economies and legal systems and sovereign risk. A further list and descriptions of these risks, uncertainties and other 
factors can be found within the Company’s related filings with the Bolsa Mexicana de Valores. Any forward-looking statement made 
in this release speaks only as of the date of this release. The Company undertakes no obligation to update or revise any forward-
looking statements, whether as a result of new information, future events or otherwise. 
 
 


